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From: John Pfleger
To: Chao, Ming-tai
Subject: FW: Fayetteville Transfer Station Agreement
Date: Tuesday, January 21, 2014 5:03:11 PM
Attachments: 2014-01-21@15.34.12[1].pdf

Mr. Chao,

I have been trying to get a copy of a completed exhibit A as you requested but we do not have
one.  Will this certificate of completion and occupancy suffice?

John Pfleger
Waste Industries
 
From: Ted Habets 
Sent: Tuesday, January 21, 2014 4:13 PM
To: John Pfleger; Lisa Inman
Subject: RE: Fayetteville Transfer Station Agreement
 
John,
 
I don’t believe that Exhibit A was ever executed, but here’s a copy of the Certificate of Completion
and Occupancy that the City of Fayetteville provided.  Will this work for you?
 
Ted
 

From: John Pfleger 
Sent: Tuesday, January 21, 2014 3:51 PM
To: Lisa Inman
Cc: Ted Habets
Subject: Re: Fayetteville Transfer Station Agreement
 
Do you think the city would have it?  DENR wants it to confirm the date lease was renewed.  Any
other suggestions for proof of start date may be helpful as well. 

Sent from my iPhone

On Jan 21, 2014, at 9:04 AM, "Lisa Inman" <Lisa.Inman@wasteindustries.com> wrote:

I don’t think we have a completed Exhibit A.
 
From: Ted Habets 
Sent: Friday, January 17, 2014 5:05 PM
To: Lisa Inman
Subject: RE: Fayetteville Transfer Station Agreement
 
I do not have a completed Exhibit A.  The lease agreement copy that’s attached is the
only one I have on file here.
 

From: Lisa Inman 
Sent: Friday, January 17, 2014 4:24 PM
To: Ted Habets
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Subject: FW: Fayetteville Transfer Station Agreement
 
Ted – Can you check your file and see if you have a fully completed Exhibit A, which is
the completion certificate.  I’m not confident we have a completed one, but it is
worth checking for.  John needs it for a DENR filing.
 
Thanks –
Lisa
 
From: John Pfleger 
Sent: Friday, January 17, 2014 4:16 PM
To: Lisa Inman
Subject: RE: Fayetteville Transfer Station Agreement
 
They want a completed “Exhibit A” pg 14 of lease agreement.  Do you have this or
could you get it?
 
From: Lisa Inman 
Sent: Friday, January 17, 2014 1:45 PM
To: John Pfleger
Subject: FW: Fayetteville Transfer Station Agreement
 
That wasn’t too hard to find!
 
From: Ted Habets 
Sent: Wednesday, October 09, 2013 3:39 PM
To: Lisa Inman
Subject: Fayetteville Transfer Station Agreement
 
 


