Wilson, Donna

From: Wilson, Donna

Sent: Friday, August 28, 2009 3:45 PM

To: '‘David Garrett'

Cc: Mussler, Ed; Bell, Wayne; Whitehurst, Judson
Subject: RE: C&D Landfill Alternate Financial Assurance

David — I've reviewed the revised closure/post-closure cost estimates for C&D Landfill, 74-07, and | have the following
comments:

1. Please breakdown the costs for the compacted soil layer and the vegetative solid layer. The cost for the
compacted soil layer and vegetative soil layer should include cost for a third party contractor to purchase and
place the soil. The soil is not on the landfill property.

2. Please justify why testing and surveying decreased significantly from $208,000 to $76,000. Does this amount
include mob/demob? Please breakdown these costs.

3. The submittal must contain the PE signature and seal.

If you have any questions, please let me know.
Thanks, Donna

Donna J. Wilson

Environmental Engineer

Solid Waste Section/Division of Waste Management/NC DENR
1646 Mail Service Center

Raleigh NC 27699-1646

Phone 919-508-8510

Section webpage - http://wastenotnc.org/swhome

New email address - donna.wilson@ncdenr.gov

E-mail correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the
North Carolina Public Records Law and may be disclosed to third parties.

From: David Garrett [mailto:david@davidgarrettpe.com]
Sent: Tuesday, August 25, 2009 2:07 PM

To: Wilson, Donna; ed.mussler@ncmail.net

Subject: C&D Landfill Alternate Financial Assurance

| thought | had already sent this to you. They need an answer for their bonding agent. Thanks, in advance, for your
prompt response.

David Garrett, P.G., P.E.
David Garrett & Associates
5105 Harbour Towne Drive
Raleigh, NC 27604

Tel. 919-418-4375 (mobile)



