Liggins, Shirlez

From: Walker, Chris <Chris.Walker@klgates.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 15, 2016 2:27 PM

To: Thompson, Jordan L; aaron.ligon@ligoncre.com
Cc: Liggins, Shirley; Wahl, Tracy

Subject: RE: 300 N College (BF#19069-15-60)

Jordan:

I’m looking forward to working with you on another project. Our apologies for the delay in submitting payment for the
invoice. PD thought that it had already submitted payment, but it slipped through the cracks. Thanks for following up
onit. PD is putting a check in the mail right away.

Please contact me with any questions.

Regards,
Chris

From: Thompson, Jordan L [mailto:jordan.thompson@ncdenr.gov]
Sent: Thursday, September 15, 2016 12:29 PM

To: aaron.ligon@ligoncre.com

Cc: Walker, Chris; Liggins, Shirley; Wahl, Tracy

Subject: 300 N College (BF#19069-15-60)

Good Afternoon Mr. Ligon,

| am the new Project Manager for the 300 N. College site that was issued a Letter of Eligibility on October 19, 2015. Our
records indicate that the initial Brownfields Application fee in the amount of $2,000 that was invoiced to you on October
19, 2015 (attached) has not been paid. Before | begin my review of the assessments that were provided with the
Brownfields Application to determine if further assessment is warranted, we will need to receive this payment. Please
submit payment to the program address on the attached invoice. Once we receive payment, | can begin to look at these
documents in detail and determine what our course of action is. Also attached is the BFA Flowchart that provides a more
detailed description of the process that we will be undertaking.

I look forward to working with you on this project and please feel free to call or email me with any questions.

Ms. Jordan Thompson

Project Manager

Brownfields Program

Department of Environmental Quality

704-235-2166 office
jordan.thompson@ncdenr.gov

610 E. Center Avenue
Suite 301
Mooresville, NC 28115




2 Nothing Compares .

Email correspondence to and from this address is subject to the
North Carolina Public Records Law and may be disclosed to third parties.

This electronic message contains information from the law firm of K&L Gates LLP. The contents may be privileged and confidential and are intended for
the use of the intended addressee(s) only. If you are not an intended addressee, note that any disclosure, copying, distribution, or use of the contents of
this message is prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please contact me at Chris Walker@klgates.com.



