Chao, Ming-tai

From: Heim, Susan A

Sent: Tuesday, April 12, 2016 2:57 PM

To: Chao, Ming-tai

Subject: FW: 3418TP - Myers Treatment and Processing Facility
Susan Heim

Environmental Senior Specialist
Division of Waste Management — Solid Waste Section

North Carolina Department of Environmental Quality

336-776-9672 office

Permit No. Date

Document ID No.

919-621-3687 mobile

3418TP April 12, 2016,

25957

susan.heim@ncdenr.gov

450 W. Hanes Mill Road, Suite 300
Winston-Salem, NC 27105-9667

Ns -~ Nothing Compares -«

Received by an e- mail

Date: April 12, 2016
Solid Waste Section
Raleigh Central Office

Email correspondence to and from this address is subject to the
North Carolina Public Records Law and may be disclosed to third parties

%lease consider the environment before printing this e-mail

From: Gerstell, Charles
Sent: Tuesday, April 12, 2016 12:07 PM
To: Heim, Susan A <susan.heim@ncdenr.gov>

Subject: FW: 3418TP - Myers Treatment and Processing Facility

Here is the e-mail conversation | had with Ed previously in reference to this site. The site was closed out last year.

Charles Gerstell

Environmental Senior Specialist

Division of Waste Management — Solid Waste Section
Department of Environmental Quality

704-235-2144 office
919-609-5563 mobile
charles.gerstell@ncdenr.gov

610 East Center Avenue, Suite 301
Mooresville, North Carolina 28115

Ns -~ Nothing Compares - .
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Email correspondence to and from this address is subject to the
North Carolina Public Records Law and may be disclosed to third parties.

From: Gerstell, Charles

Sent: Tuesday, July 07, 2015 12:54 PM

To: Mussler, Ed <ed.mussler@ncdenr.gov>

Subject: RE: 3418TP - Myers Treatment and Processing Facility

Ed,
| appreciate the information. | will request that he submit an official letter stating his intent to not renew the permit. |
will also copy you on the inspection report.

Thanks,
C.T.

Charles Gerstell - Charles.Gerstell@ncdenr.gov

North Carolina Dept. of Environment and Natural Resources
Div. of Waste Management - Solid Waste Section

610 E. Center Ave., Suite 301

Mooresville, NC 28115

Ph: (704) 235-2144  Fax: (704) 663-6040
http://portal.ncdenr.org/web/wm/sw

E-mail correspondence to and from this address is subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and may be
disclosed to third parties unless the content is exempt by statute or regulation.

From: Mussler, Ed

Sent: Tuesday, July 07, 2015 12:52 PM

To: Gerstell, Charles

Subject: RE: 3418TP - Myers Treatment and Processing Facility

Thanks for the reminder. The permit has expired, but if we could ask Mr Meyer to send a letter indicating that they are
not renewing the permit, we can send a letter and close the site. He may have just gotten an invoice for yearly fees, so
this is a good time to finish it.

From: Gerstell, Charles

Sent: Thursday, July 02, 2015 10:29 AM

To: Mussler, Ed

Cc: Aja, Deborah

Subject: 3418TP - Myers Treatment and Processing Facility

Ed,

| recently inspected the subject site which is a stand-alone treatment and processing facility. | checked with Tony
Gallagher to see if he would be the contact for permitting questions, but he stated that the facility was not on his
database, so he felt that this site may still be under your direction as you signed the last Permit to Construct/Operate
for the facility back in 2010. Mr. Herb Myers recently passed away, and his son, Marty expressed that he has no plans to
renew the permit for the facility. Inspection found that all waste had been removed from the facility with the exception
of a very small amount of brush. The site has been graded to not impound water. So, my question is do we need an



official letter from the permit holder officially stating that they wish to close the site out? If so, who does this letter need
to be sent to? The permit for the facility has expired. | have attached a photo of the facility for your review.

Thanks,
C.T.

Charles Gerstell - Charles.Gerstell@ncdenr.gov

North Carolina Dept. of Environment and Natural Resources
Div. of Waste Management - Solid Waste Section

610 E. Center Ave., Suite 301

Mooresville, NC 28115

Ph: (704) 235-2144  Fax: (704) 663-6040
http://portal.ncdenr.org/web/wm/sw

E-mail correspondence to and from this address is subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and may be
disclosed to third parties unless the content is exempt by statute or regulation.



Chao, Ming-tai

From: Heim, Susan A

Sent: Tuesday, April 12, 2016 2:57 PM

To: Chao, Ming-tai

Subject: FW: North Carolina Permitted Solid Waste Facility Annual Fee for FY 2015-2016 - Myers

LCID Treatment And Processing

Susan Heim

Environmental Senior Specialist

Division of Waste Management — Solid Waste Section
North Carolina Department of Environmental Quality

336-776-9672 office
919-621-3687 mobile
susan.heim@ncdenr.gov

450 W. Hanes Mill Road, Suite 300
Winston-Salem, NC 27105-9667

Ns 7 MNothing Compares .

Email correspondence to and from this address is subject to the
North Carolina Public Records Law and may be disclosed to third parties

b%"lease consider the environment before printing this e-mail

From: Gerstell, Charles

Sent: Tuesday, April 12, 2016 12:13 PM

To: Heim, Susan A <susan.heim@ncdenr.gov>

Subject: FW: North Carolina Permitted Solid Waste Facility Annual Fee for FY 2015-2016 - Myers LCID Treatment And
Processing

Charles Gerstell

Environmental Senior Specialist

Division of Waste Management — Solid Waste Section
Department of Environmental Quality

704-235-2144 office
919-609-5563 mobile
charles.gerstell@ncdenr.gov

610 East Center Avenue, Suite 301
Mooresville, North Carolina 28115



Ns **Nothing Compares -

Email correspondence to and from this address is subject to the
North Carolina Public Records Law and may be disclosed to third parties.

From: Donna Myers [mailto:lewisvillelandfill@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, July 13, 2015 2:06 PM

To: Johnson, Mary H <mary.johnson@ncdenr.gov>

Cc: Gerstell, Charles <charles.gerstell@ncdenr.gov>

Subject: Re: North Carolina Permitted Solid Waste Facility Annual Fee for FY 2015-2016 - Myers LCID Treatment And
Processing

We are not renewing out permit.
Thanks!

Donna Myers, Bookkeeper
LewisvilleLandfill@gmail.com
336-546-1687

5600 Country Club Road
Winston-Salem, NC 27104

On Jul 1, 2015, at 10:00 AM, Johnson, Mary H <mary.johnson @ncdenr.gov> wrote:

Dear Donna Myers,

Attached to this message you will find an invoice for Fiscal Year 2015-2016 for your North
Carolina Permitted Solid Waste Facility.

Besides paper checks, you may pay using e-check or credit card by visiting
http://portal.ncdenr.org/web/wm/sw/epayment. You will need to use the zip code in the
description box and the invoice number shown on this invoice to access your account. If a zip
code is not listed use the code: 99999 along with the invoice number. Proceed with your
payment by following the instructions on the e-payment screen.

If the contact details or other pertinent information as shown in this e-mail or on the invoice is
incorrect, please update the information on the invoice and return it to this office.

Thank you for your prompt attention to this matter.

Mary Johnson

N.C. Department of Environment and Natural Resources
Division of Waste Management - Solid Waste Section
phone: (919) 707-8236 email: mary.johnson@ncdenr.gov




<3418TP-TP-_2015_Annuallnvoice.pdf>



