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Make checks payable to N.C. Division of Waste Management, Solid Waste Section, include Permit Number and

invoice number on check. If you are paying by electronic transfer, include the invoice number with your electronic transfer.
[G.S. 25-3-506: A $25.00 processing fee will be charged on all returned checks.] Please return a copy of this invoice

with your payment.

Applicant Address: Contact/Billing Information: Facility Location Address:
Mr. Dave Jones Mr. Dave Jones
GreeneCounty CDLF GreerpCounty CDLF
PO Box543 PO Box543
Snow Hill NC 28580 Snow Hill NC 28580
INVOICE NUMBER INVOICE DATE DUE DATE AMOUNT DUE
SWO010-0058 06-29-2010 $6000.00

A. Permit Fee Requirements: Pursuant to North Carolina General Statute 130A-295.8 you are required to pay fee(s)
based on your solid waste management activities. The fee(s) shall be used to support the solid waste management
program. An application is deemed incomplete until all fees are received.

B. Explanation of Invoice Amount is Based on Facility’s Current Permit Application

Facility Facility Application Application
Permit # Type Type Date Fee Total Amount
4002-CDLF-1997 CDLF Amendment- 6-24-10 $6000.00 $6000.00
substantial
increase in
capacity
Total Amount Due $6000.00
Amount Paid

C. Remit Payment (including a copy of this invoice) To:

Division of Waste Management
Solid Waste Section b

1646 Mail Service Center
Raleigh, NC 27699-1646
Attn: Ellen Lorscheider

D. Solid Waste Contacts:
1. Questions about billing process: Jeff Skabo (919)508-8504 or Ellen Lorscheider at (919) 508-8499

2. Questions about the Regulations and Technical Assistance:
Ed Mussler (919) 508-8495 Landfills, Transfer Stations
Michael Scott (919) 508-8513 Land Application Sites, Compost Facilities

E. Update Your Information: Please indicate any changes in Facility or Contact Information.
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Skabo, Jeffery

From: Chao, Ming-tai

Sent: Thursday, June 24, 2010 3:40 PM

To: Skabo, Jeffery

Cc: Mussler, Ed

Subject: FW: Permit Fee for Greene County C&DLF, permit # 40-02
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Hey jeff: Could you please invoice Green County additional $6,000. Thanks.

Ming -~
R Me. Qe Sones, G’feeaCcuM«(Cﬂ \F
From: Lorscheider, Ellen
Sent: Thursday, June 24, 2010 3:35 PM PO w S-q 3
To: Chao, Ming-tai : N .
Subject: RE: Permit Fee for Greene County C&DLF, permit # 40-02 SV[&\O 1‘-}‘ L( V\,(‘J

I agree. Jeff needs to resend the biil and edit it to show that it is a substantial amendment and they owe $6000. %

From: Chao, Ming-tai

Sent: Thursday, June 24, 2010 3:28 PM

To: Lorscheider, Ellen; Skabo, Jeffery

Cc: Mussler, Ed

Subject: Permit Fee for Greene County C&DLF, permit # 40-02

Ellen & Jeff: Greene County requested a permit amendment for continued operation of Greene County
C&DLF (Phase 2), on top of the closed MSWLF (Phase 1) in accordance with Rule .0547(4). The
permit application originally submitted by June 30, 2008 without a comprehensive Facility Plan but
providing the drawing to show the final grade of elevation of 144 feet amsl in the Closure Plan, which T
believe that is consistent to the Permit Modification # 3. On May 20, 2010 a set of facility plan
drawings (still no Facility Plan) along with the revised permit application were submitted by Greene
County to respond DWM demand of a comprehensive Facility Plan (DWM letter dated 10/23/2009 [Doc
ID8828]).

According to the submitted facility drawings, Greene County C&DLF will:

- Bedeveloped the C&DLF by 5 phases (Phase 2 thru. Phase 7) in next 30 more years (as of
05/08/2009) with approximately total capacity of 531,307 cy (including 409,284 cy un-used space)

- Have the maximum final grade (at the end of Phase 7) at the elevation of 216 feet amsl with a 3 to 1
side slopes.

However, according to the approved Facility Plan in the “Construction & Demolition Landfill for
Greene County” dated December 1, 1997, the originally approved total capacity is 352,500 cy. The
proposed landfill capacity (531,307 cy ) will increase 50% more than the originally approved one
(352,500 cy), and it is a substantial permit amendment. I think we need charge the county permit
substantial amendment fee of $15,000. Since Green County has paid the permit amendment fee of
$9,000 on 11/24/2008, the county needs to pay the remaining balance of $6,000.

Ming Chao



