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Ritter, Christine

From: Ritter, Christine
Sent: Monday, October 26, 2015 3:09 PM
To: James Adams
Cc: Whaley, Mary; Rice, Sarah M; Mussler, Ed; Watkins, Jason; 'Stacey Smith'
Subject: RE: Revised Financial Assurance for Capital Materials and Recycling

Hi  James- 
 
The NC Solid Waste Section has reviewed the revised Financial Assurance estimate submitted on your behalf by Stacey 
Smith of Smith + Gardner, Inc. and approves the proposed remedial response number of $239,030 which is provided 
primarily to crush and screen unprocessed concrete debris into a recycled concrete aggregate material and to grind and 
process woody debris remaining on site.  Sarah Rice will be contacting you to handle the revised financial assurance 
number with your bank. 
 
On a separate matter, we are requesting information regarding your proposed mulch colorizing operation as a water well 
has been verified as installed at the site for this purpose. The current approved operation plan for the Capital Materials 
T&P facility does not include the mulch colorizing operation; therefore the NC Solid Waste Section requires additional 
information prior to authorizing this proposed operation. 
 
If you have any questions or concerns, please call or email me at my contact information below. 
 
 
Christine Ritter (Christine.Ritter@ncdenr.gov) 
Hydrogeologist 
Solid Waste Section/Division of Waste Management 
NC Department of Environmental Quality 
Tel: (919) 707-8254 
web: http://portal.ncdenr.org/web/wm/sw 
 
PHYSICAL ADDRESS:                     MAILING ADDRESS: 
217 WEST JONES ST.                    1646 MAIL SERVICE CENTER 
RALEIGH, NC 27603                     RALEIGH, NC 27699-1646 
 
 
 
 
 

From: Stacey Smith [mailto:stacey@smithgardnerinc.com]  
Sent: Monday, October 19, 2015 4:16 PM 
To: Ritter, Christine <christine.ritter@ncdenr.gov> 
Cc: Whaley, Mary <mary.whaley@ncdenr.gov>; Rice, Sarah M <sarah.rice@ncdenr.gov>; James Adams 
<jma19@me.com> 
Subject: Revised Financial Assurance for Capital Materials and Recycling 
 
Christine, 
  
Please find our revised financial assurance estimate for the Capital Materials and Recycling facility.  We have attempted 
to similarly address the recent installation of the water well in this correspondence. 
  
Please feel free to call me with any questions or concerns.   
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Thanks, 
  
sas 
  
Stacey A. Smith, P.E. 
President, Senior Engineer 
 

SMITH + GARDNER 
 

14 N. Boylan Avenue 
Raleigh, NC 27603 

P (919) 828.0577  
C (919) 815.0803 

www.smithgardnerinc.com 

  
  


